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This book examines the usefulness of economic sanctions in the prevention of the proliferation of Weapons
of Mass Destruction (WMD). Focusing on nuclear proliferation and utilizing the existing sanctions literature,
this book examines three cases where sanctions played a role in U.S. policy. The cases are South Africa,
Libya and Iraq, and the thesis’ findings demonstrate that sanctions are a useful nonproliferation tool. Further,
this book delivers several insights into what factors ensure policy success when using economic coercion to
convince countries to give up their WMD. Security assurances, for example, can be useful in using sanctions
as a nonproliferation tool. By contrast, threats of regime change can create disincentives for leadership to
alter WMD-acquisition strategies. This is especially true when the U.S. Congress adds other conditions to
WMD-specific sanctions. Inconsistencies in U.S. nonproliferation policy can also motivate states to acquire
WMD, if countries believe Washington has turned a blind eye to an enemy’s WMD programs. This book
takes these insights forward to examine the evolving sanctions regime against Iran’s nuclear program. It
concludes that, without cautious adjustment to U.S. policy, these sanctions are likely to fail.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Richardson:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled Assessing the Net Effects of Sanctions on the Proliferation on
Weapons of Mass Destruction. Try to the actual book Assessing the Net Effects of Sanctions on the
Proliferation on Weapons of Mass Destruction as your close friend. It means that it can to become your
friend when you really feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah,
it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you more confidence because you can know anything by the
book. So , let us make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Michel Wilkerson:

With other case, little persons like to read book Assessing the Net Effects of Sanctions on the Proliferation
on Weapons of Mass Destruction. You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. So long as
we know about how is important any book Assessing the Net Effects of Sanctions on the Proliferation on
Weapons of Mass Destruction. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by the
book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can realize everything! From your country right up
until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you can know that. In
this era, we could open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can use it when
you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's go through.

Hoyt Moore:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't want
do that. You must know how great and also important the book Assessing the Net Effects of Sanctions on the
Proliferation on Weapons of Mass Destruction. All type of book is it possible to see on many resources. You
can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Christopher Jorge:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find guide that need more time to be
examine. Assessing the Net Effects of Sanctions on the Proliferation on Weapons of Mass Destruction can be
your answer as it can be read by anyone who have those short free time problems.
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